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 July 28th – August 1st Holi-daily 
Hello and welcome to the 2014 Summer of Mini Madness Summer Camp!  We are 

delighted to meet your child and to have him/her as a camper this summer!  This 

newsletter will serve to inform you and your child about the upcoming events for the 

week.  Please be sure to send your child to camp with a lunch, drink, and the suggested 

items for that day.  We are looking forward to five full days packed with the best 

summertime activities!  

MONDAY                                                   

Welcome to camp! Today we’ll have our 
madness huddle and then start by celebrating 
Saint Patrick’s Day. Get ready to make 
handprint leprechauns and go on a treasure 
hunt for gold! BRING: Lunch and a drink. 
Green clothes a plus. 

TUESDAY                                                            

Today is Valentines Day at Menlo Madness! 
Bring a big heart and be prepared to spread a 
lot of love. Awww! BRING: Lunch and a drink. 

WEDNESDAY                                            

Guess what everyone! Today is your Birthday! 
Let’s celebrate with a field trip to the Movie 
Theater to watch the new Planes: Fire and 
Rescue Movie! BRING: Lunch and a drink and 
don't forget your camp t-shirt! 

THURSDAY                                                         

I hope your hungry! Because today is 
Thanksgiving! We will be having a delicious  
potluck feast and be making turkey themed 
crafts. BRING:  Details of potluck to be 
announced. 

FRIDAY 
It’s Halloween at Menlo Madness and 
costumes are encouraged! But don’t forget to 
bring your bathing suit as we’ll be swimming 
in the Burgess pool this afternoon. Camper 
certificates will be distributed so parents are 
welcome to join us at the end of the day!  
BRING: Costumes are optional but don’t 
forget your swimsuit, towel, sunscreen and 
lunch! 
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FAST FORWARD: 

Schuyler 

Want to stay in touch with the madness? Check out 

menloparksummercamp.blogspot.com 

Next week is Child vs. Wild Week!  

Space is still available so don't miss out and sign up! 
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